Chula Vista Municipal Code

19.24.040

Chapter 19.24
R-1-SINGLE-FAMILY RESIDENCE ZONE

Sections:

19.24.010 Purpose.

19.24.020 Permitted uses.

19.24.030 Accessory uses and buildings.

19.24.040 Conditional uses.

19.24.050 Repealed.

19.24.060 Height regulations.

19.24.070 Area, lot width and yard requirements.

19.24.080 Standards for application—R-1-7 zone
classification.

19.24.090 Standards for application—R-1-5 zone
classification.

19.24.100 Setbacks — Requirements generally.

19.24.110 Frontage requirements.

19.24.120 Setbacks — Rear yards — Exceptions
permitted when.

19.24.130 Floor area per unit.

19.24.140 Off-street parking.

19.24.150 Performance standards.

19.24.160 Fencing requirements.

19.24.170 Panhandle lots, flag lots, or lots served
by an easement — Requirements and
conditions.

19.24.180 Floor area ratio.

19.24.190 Building additions and remodeling.

19.24.010 Purpose.

The purpose of this zone is to stabilize and pro-
tect the residential characteristics of the areas so
designated and to promote and encourage a suit-
able environment for family life. The R-1 zone is
basically intended to provide communities prima-
rily for single-family detached homes and the ser-
vices appurtenant thereto. (Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969;
prior code § 33.503(A)).

19.24.020 Permitted uses.

Principal permitted uses in the R-1 zone include:

A. One single-family dwelling on any lot;

B. Factory-built home/mobilehome on any lot,
subject to the provisions of CVMC 19.58.145 and
19.58.330;

C. All portions of the dwelling, factory-built
home or mobilehome used for living or sleeping
purposes shall be attached by common walls;

D. Large family day care homes, subject to the
provisions of CVMC 19.58.147. (Ord. 2260 § 1,
1988; Ord. 2161 § 1, 1986; Ord. 1941 § 1, 1981;
Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.503(B)).

19.24.030 Accessory uses and buildings.

Accessory uses permitted in the R-1 zone
include:

A. Rooming and boarding of not more than two
persons; provided, off-street parking space is avail-
able for any automobile owned or operated by any
boarder or roomer, in addition to any space
required for the principal residents of the dwelling;

B. Customary incidental home occupations and
professional offices, subject to the provisions of
CVMC 19.14.490;

C. The keeping of cats and/or dogs, not to
exceed the number permitted by the animal ordi-
nance for each dwelling unit;

D. Full-time foster homes-and small family day
care homes, as defined in CVMC 19.04.095 and
19.04.098;

E. Other accessory uses and accessory build-
ings customarily appurtenant to a permitted use,
subject to the requirements of Chapter 19.58
CVMC,;

F. Satellite dish antennas as per the provisions
of CVMC 19.22.030(F);

G. Temporary tract offices and tract signs, sub-
ject to the provisions of CVMC 19.58.320 and
19.60.470;

H. Agricultural uses as provided in CVMC
19.16.030;

I. Satellite dish antennas as per the provisions
of CVMC 19.22.030(F);

J. Large family day care homes, subject to the
provisions of CVMC 19.58.147;

K. Accessory second dwelling units, subject to
the provisions of CVMC 19.58.022. (Ord. 2897 § 4,
2003; Ord. 2269 § 5, 1988; Ord. 2160 § 1, 1986;
Ord. 2145 § 1, 1986; Ord. 2138 §-1, 1986; Ord.
2124§5,1985;0rd. 2117 § 1,1985;0rd. 2111 § 4,
1985; Ord. 1575 § 1, 1974; Ord. 1494 § 1, 1973;
Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior
code § 33.503(C)).

19.24.040 Conditional uses.

Site plan and architectural approval as provided
in CVMC 19.14.420 through 19.14.480 shall be
required for the following conditional uses in the
R-1 zone:

A. Dwelling groups, subject to the provisions
of CVMC 19.58.130;

B. Electric substations and gas regulators, sub-
ject to the provisions of CVMC 19.58.140;

C. Unclassified uses, see Chapter 19.54
CVMC;

D. Private, noncommercial, recreational facili-
ties, such as swimming pools, tennis courts, and

(Revised 1/04)



19.24.050

clubhouses (for additional provisions, see CVMC
19.58.100 and 19.58.270);

E. Professional offices (for additional provi-
sions, see CVMC 19.58.244). (Ord. 2269 §6,
1988; Ord. 2260 § I, 1988; Ord. 2111 § 5, 1985;
Ord. 1822 § 1, 1978; Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord.
1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.503(D)).

19.24.050 Sign regulations.

Repealed by Ord. 2924 § 3, 2003. (Ord. 1575
§ 1, 1974; Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212 § 1,
1969; prior code § 33.503(E)).

19.24.060 Height regulations.

. ~ Principal buildings may not exceed two and one-
half stories or 28 feet in height; however, an in-
crease in building height may be allowed subject to
approval of a conditional use permit. No accessory
building shall exceed one and one-half stories or 15
feet in height except as provided in CVMC
19.16.040. The height of a residential structure is

measured from the highest point of the roof line to
finished grade. (Ord. 2144 § 3, 1986; Ord. 1356
§ 1,1971;0rd. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.503

)2

19.24.070 Area, lot width and yard
requirements.

Area, lot width, and yard requirements in the R-1
zone are as follows (see CVMC 19.16.020,
19.16.050, 19.16.060 and 19.16.080 for exceptions
and modifications):

A. All buildings, including accessory buildings
and structures in the single-family residence zone
shall not cover more than 40 percent of the lot.

B. Minimum Dimensions. The following mini-
mum dimensions shall be observed; provided,
however, that such dimensions may be modified by
the granting of a conditional use permit. The mini-
mum requirements shall be one of the following
district classifications as designated on the zoning
map:

Setbacks in Feet
Minimum Lot | Minimum Lot Exterior One Side | Both Side
Classification | Area (sq. ft.) Width (ft.) Front Side Yard Yard Yards Rear

R-1-15 15,000 85 25 10 10 20 20
R-1-10 10,000 70 20 10 10 15 20
R-1-7 7,000 60 5 10 10 13 20

6,000 60 15 10 10 13 20
R-1-5 5,000 50 s L 10 5 10 1
(Revised 1/04) 19-68



Chula Vista Municipal Code

19.24.120

C. Existing developed lots of record (May 23,
1989) in the R-1-7 zone which measure less than
60 feet in width at the front setback may maintain
the minimum side yards as noted above for the R-
1-5 district for replacements or additions which
constitute less than 50 percent of the floor area of
the existing dwelling. (Ord. 2311 § 1, 1989; Ord.
1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1237 § 1, 1969; Ord. 1212
§ 1, 1969; prior code § 33.503(G)).

19.24.080 Standards for application - R-1-7
zone classification.

The R-1-7 zone classification and the minimum
dimensions requirement prescribed for said classi-
fication shall be considered to be the basic or stan-
dard lot size throughout the city; provided,
however, that in those areas placed in the R-1-7
classification, if a subdivision map is filed, the
minimum lot sizes for 20 percent of the lots created
by said subdivision may be reduced to 6,000 square
feet, and 10 percent of the lots thus created may be
reduced to 5,000 square feet, said lots being subject
to those minimum dimensional requirements as set
forth hereinabove for such lot areas; provided, that
the average lot size of all the lots within the subdi-
vision shall equal a minimum of 7,000 square feet.
(Ord. 1500 § 2, 1973; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior
code § 33.503(H)(1)).

19.24.090 Standards for application - R-1-5
zone classification.

The incorporation of any properties into the
R-1-5 classification shall be restricted to those
areas deemed most appropriate in accordance with
the basic principles set forth herein. Particular
attention will be given to the character of the
topography involved so as to insure the capability
of accommodating lots of this size in a manner that
would provide appropriate usable level space for
each lot. The filing and approval of a final subdivi-
sion map will be required prior to any such R-1-5
zoning becoming effective, and in addition, a pre-
cise plan may be required as provided in CVMC
19.12.120. Said map should insure that the density
of the subdivision will be properly related to that
existing or proposed in surrounding areas, and that
the development will not be incompatible with
sound neighborhood density standards, and fur-
ther, that public facilities will not be overburdened.
Open space should be provided or available in the
form of natural canyons, green belts, park areas or
such other forms which would contribute to better
land use and design and accommodate the recre-
ational needs of families who would be living in

areas designated for 5,000 square foot minimum
lot sizes. (Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.503
(H)2)).

19.24.100 Setbacks — Requirements generally.

Front and side yard setback requirements for
particular zone classifications shall be provided
and maintained in accordance with the schedule set
forth hereinabove, or in accordance with those
specified in the building line map. Those setback
requirements as shown on the adopted building line
map of the city shall be adhered to in any case
where said requirements differ from setbacks
established in said schedule. Furthermore, regard-
less of any minimum-side yard requirements as
indicated in said schedule, the minimum distance
between dwelling units shall be 10 feet, and no
dwelling unit may be constructed closer than three
feet to any side property line with the exception of
the R-1-5 zone classification which shall maintain
a minimum of five feet. Said minimum three-foot
dimension shall be measured on a horizontal plane
on the level of the foundation of the dwelling unit.
(Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior
code § 33.503(I)(1)).

19.24.110 Frontage requirements.

Every lotin the R-1 zone having an area between
5,000 square feet and 5,999 square feet shall have
a minimum lot frontage upon a dedicated street of
50 feet, and every lot having an area of 6,000 square
feet or greater shall have a minimum lot frontage
upon a dedicated street of 60 feet, unless such lots
front upon an approved easement or private road as
provided for in this chapter (see CVMC 19.24.170)
or unless such lots have been approved by the plan-
ning commission or_city council pursuant to the
provisions of this code or any ordinance which may
hereafter be enacted providing for the subdivision
of land or the dedication of public streets. (Ord.
1868§ 1,1979;0rd. 1356 § 1,1971;0rd. 1212 § 1,

" 1969; prior code § 33.503(I)(2)).

19.24.120 Setbacks - Rear yards - Exceptions
permitted when.

In the R-1 zone, single-story structures attached
to the main building may be located within 10 feet
of the rear property line, but shall not be closer than
five feet from any retaining wall or toe of slope and
said structure shall not occupy more than 30 per-
cent of the rear yard area. Rear yards that have an
elevation difference of six feet or more from the
adjoining lot or parcel may reduce said 10 feet one
foot for every foot over six feet but not more than

(Revised 7/07)



19.24.130

five feet. Two-story portions of the building shall
not be closer than the required rear yard setback.
(Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior
code § 33.503(I:(3)).

19.24.130 Floor area per unit.

Minimum floor area in the R-1 zone shall be as
follows:

A. One thousand (1,000) square feet for each
dwelling unit containing one bedroom, two bed-
rooms, or one bedroom and den, family room or
any other such room designated for miscellaneous
purposes;

B. One thousand two hundred (1,200) square

- feet for each dwelling unit containing three bed-
rooms or two bedrooms and den, family room or
any other such room designated for miscellaneous
purposes;

C. One thousand three hundred (1,300) square
feet for each dwelling containing four bedrooms or
three bedrooms and den, family room or any other
such room designated for miscellaneous purposes,
or more.

Exception: Except in the case of the 1,000
square feet dwelling units, an applicant may reduce
the above minimums by 200 square feet per unit for
30 percent of the dwellings within an approved
subdivision; provided, the average house size
within the development conforms to the minimum
requirements specified above. (Ord. 1500 § 3,
1973; Ord. 1356 § 1. 1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969;
prior code § 33.503(J)).

19.24.140 Off-street parking.

The two-car garage requirement applies in the
R-1 zone (see CVMC 19.62.170 through 19.62.190
for garage requirements and conversions). (Ord.
1356 § 1, 1971: Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code
§ 33.503(K)).

19.24.150 Performance standards.

All uses in the R-1 zone may be subject to the
initial and continued compliance with the perfor-
mance standards in Chapter 19.66 CVMC. (Ord.
1356 § 1, 1971: Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code
§ 33.503(L)).

19.24.160 Fencing requirements.

See CVMC 19.58.130 for fencing requirements
in the R-1 zone. (Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212
§ 1, 1969; prior code § 33.503(M)).

19.24.170 Panhandle lots, flag lots, or lots .
served by an easement —
Requirements and conditions.

Panhandle lots, flag lots, or lots served by an
easement shall be provided in the R-1 zone subject
to the requirements and conditions of CVMC

19.22.150. (Ord. 1868 § 2, 1979).

19.24.180 Floor area ratio.

Construction of dwellings or any remodeling or
additions to existing dwellings shall have a floor
area ratio (FAR) which limits the maximum build-
ing area to 45 percent of the lot area for single-fam-
ily dwellings on lots of 7,000 square feet or greater
and 50 percent of the lot area or 3,150 square feet,
whichever is less, for single-family dwellings on
lots of less than 7,000 square feet. The floor area
ratio calculation shall also include the square foot-
age of patios, garages and other accessory struc-
tures present on the lot, but excluding covered
patios open on at least two sides and covered
porches open on at least one side with a total com-
bined area of 300 square feet or less. For these pur- -
poses, an “accessory structure” is defined as any
structure which rises four or more feet above fin-
ished grade. (Ord. 2559 § 4, 1993; Ord. 2144 § 3,
1986).

19.24.190 Building additions and remodeling.

See CVMC 19.22.170 for limitations to remod-
eling or additions to existing dwellings. (Ord. 2144
§ 3, 1980).

(Revised 7/07)



Chula Vista Municipal Code

8.24.080

public highway, street, lane, alley or other public
place within the corporate limits of the city. (Ord.
2992 § 1, 2005; Ord. 2764 § 1, 1998).

8.24.045  Solid waste generated off-site —
Placement in city trash containers —
Prohibited.

City solid waste and litter containers are placed
in city parks, at bus stops and other public areas for
the use of the public to control litter and solid waste
which is generated at or near the location where the
solid waste containers are located; they are not to
be used as disposal sites for solid waste which is
generated off-site, except as defined as incidental
waste in CVMC 8.25.020. Therefore, it is unlawful
for any person to place, dump, deposit or throw
away solid waste of any kind or character whatso-
ever other than incidental waste in city litter or
solid waste containers, if such was generated at a
location other than where the solid waste or litter
container is located. (Ord. 2992 § 1, 2005; Ord.
2764 § 1, 1998).

8.24.050  Solid waste — Disposal on private
property prohibited — Exception.

It is unlawful for any person to place, dump,
deposit or throw away any solid waste or other
waste discards of any kind or character whatso-
ever, upon any private property adjacent to or abut-
ting upon any public highway, or public place, or
upon any private property whatsoever, within the
corporation limits of the city, unless such person
first obtains the written permission of the owner of
such property so to do. It is further unlawful for
such person to deposit or place such materials in
any solid waste container owned or used by the
owner of such property, unless such person first
obtains the written permission of the owner so to
do. This section is not intended to preclude a per-
son from disposing of waste generated at a busi-
ness in containers provided for customers of the
business, such as empty food containers being
placed in public waste containers at a fast food res-
taurant. (Ord. 2992 § 1, 2005; Ord. 2764 §1,
1998).

Owner or occupant responsibility to
maintain sanitary premises.

Every owner, tenant, 0ccupant or person owning
or having the care and control of any premises in the
city shall keep said premises or those under his/her
care and control in a clean and sanitary condition,
and no person shall permit any solid waste or any
other substance which may be or will become

8.24.060

offensive to be deposited or to remain in or upon
any premises owned or occupied by him or under
his care and control, except as otherwise expressly
permitted by this chapter. It shall be the responsi-
bility of such person to provide for weekly sched-
uled solid waste collection service by means of the
city’s contract or franchise agent and pay for such
services pursuant to this chapter. However, any
such person subject to the mandatory requirement
may remove or convey their own waste to a state-
permitted landfill or transfer station by applying for
an exemption in writing in advance and receiving
such exemption pursuant to CVMC 8.24.180. Any
dispute as to such exemption may be appealed to
the city manager. (Ord~2992 § -1, 2005; Ord. 2764
§ 1, 1998).
8.24.070  Solid waste — Collection prohibited
when - Burning prohibited.

A. No person shall collect, remove or convey,
or cause or permit to be collected, removed or con-
veyed, any residential, commercial or industrial
solid waste upon or along any public street, alley or
any other public place in the city; provided, how-
ever, the prohibitions of this section shall not apply
to authorized employees of the city, or to any per-
son or firm or employees thereof, with whom the
city or a local school district has entered into a con-
tract or franchise for the collection, removal or dis-
posal of solid waste, or to the occupant or owner of
any residence personally removing their own solid
waste from said residence or commercial establish-
ment or as may otherwise be permitted or required
by federal or state laws that legally supersede the
provisions of this chapter. Occupants or owners
removing or conveying their own waste shall com-
ply with the provisions of this chapter and all local
state and federal regulation regarding the safe
transportation and disposal of wastes.

B. Itis unlawful for any person to burn or bury
any solid waste as a means of disposing of said
waste. (Ord. 2992 § 1, 2003; Ord. 2764 § 1, 1998).
8.24.080  Solid waste — Containers approved
for use by small quantity generators
(single-family residential and small
businesses with cart service) and
large quantity generators (bin or
roll-off service) for solid waste, yard
waste and recyclables.

A. Itis unlawful for any small quantity genera-
tor in a residential area to keep or store any solid
waste and recyclables ‘within containers except
those provided by the city contract or franchise

8-29

(Revised 3/05)



limited to the staging
ulance from a residen-

ted parking spaces for
dyees are required. The
iite and meet city stan-
's and screening.

es and periodic inspec-
: than three employees
time.

ats the planning com-
o minimize impacts on
L

e storing of multiple
lowed in a residential
of a hospital complex
facility. Vehicles that
:idered “stored.” (Ord.

les.

«d in subsection (B) of
:s, motor trucks and
1 the Vehicle Code of
ell as boats, campers,
| any residential zone
nditions are met:
ated in subsection (B)
, boats, campers and
rithin a garage or car-
. gate or wall not less

s, boats, campers and
a business;

s, boats, campers and
:en the hours of 10:00

n is intended to pro-
repairs, such as tire
ent of spark plugs and
r repair, lubrication,
nts or repair by an
d owner’s lot, where
sarked as determined

vehicles.

chicle or one boat, or
Ul be in a state of dis-
dition at any one time

» of disrepair or in an
located outside of a
nce, gate or wall not




Chula Vista Municipal Code

19.58.280

less than six feet in height for a period of more than
72 hours.

3. No parts of a vehicle, boat, camper or
trailer shall be located outside of a garage, carport
or solid fence, gate or wall not less than six feet in
height for a period of more than 72 hours. (Ord.
2308 § 1,1989;0rd. 2176 § 5,1986; Ord. 1356 § 1,
1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.901

(B)(26))-

19.58.270 Retail sales for guests only.

Community buildings, private clubs, lodges and
social or recreational establishments may engage
in retail sales for guests only; provided, that:

A. There shall be no external evidence of any
commercial activity, nor any access to any space
used for commercial activity other than from
within the building;

B. There shall be no harm to adjacent existing
or potential residential development due to exces-
sive traffic generation or noise or other circum-
stances. (Ord. 1356 § 1,1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969;
prior code § 33.901(B)(27)).

19.58.280 Service stations.
Service stations are subject to the following
requirements and conditions:

19-154.1

(Revised 8/04)



Chula Vista Municipal Code

10.84.020

10.80.110 Costs — Assessment and collection
procedures.

If the administrative costs and the cost of
removal which are charged against the owner of a
parcel of land pursuant to Section 38771, et seq., of
the Government Code and Chapter 1.30 CVMCare
not paid within 30 days of the date of the order, or
the final disposition of an appeal therefrom, such
costs shall be assessed against the parcel of land
pursuant to Section 38773.5 of the Government
Code and shall be transmitted to the tax collector
for collection. Said assessment shall have the same
priority as other city taxes. (Ord. 2670 § 1, 1996;
Ord. 2668, 1996; Ord. 1676 § 1, 1976; Ord. 1338
§ 1, 1971; prior code § 19.2307(B)(4)).

10.80.120 Removal of vehicles from streets
authorized when.

Any regularly employed and salaried officer of
the police department may remove or cause to be
removed:

A. Any vehicle which is parked or left standing
upon a street or highway for 72 or more consecu-
tive hours;

B. Any vehicle which is parked on a highway in
violation of any provision of this title, the Vehicle
Code or other law or ordinance forbidding standing
or parking, when the use of such highway or a por-
tion thereof is necessary for the cleaning, repair or
construction of the highway or for the installation
of underground utilities, and signs giving notice
that such vehicle may be removed are erected and
placed at least 24 hours prior to the removal,

C. Any vehicle parked upon a highway which
has been authorized by the council or other compe-
tent authority for a purpose other than the normal
flow of traffic, or for the movement of equipment,
articles or structures of unusual size, and the park-
ing of said vehicle would prohibit or interfere with
such use or movement, providing that signs giving
notice that such vehicle may be removed are
erected or placed at least 24 hours prior to the
removal of such vehicle;

D. Any vehicle parked or left standing, when
the city council by resolution or ordinance has pro-
hibited such parking and has authorized the
removal by ordinance. No vehicle may be removed
unless signs are posted giving notice of the
removal. (Ord. 2718 § 1, 1998; Ord. 2670 § 1,
1996; Ord. 2668, 1996; Ord. 973 § 1, 1966; prior
code § 19.3.5).

Chapter 10.84

PARKING RESTRICTED ON
PRIVATE PROPERTY

Sections:

10.84.010 Purpose and intent of provisions —
Parked vehicles declared nuisance —
When.

10.84.020 Parking prohibited on portions of
private property.

10.84.030 Citation of vehicles parked in
prohibited areas.

10.84.035 Citation authority.

10.84.036 Repealed™* " -

10.84.010 Purpose and intent of provisions —
Parked vehicles declared nuisance -
When.

The purpose and intent of the council in adopt-
ing CVMC 10.84.010 through 10.84.030 is to
establish procedures for the notification, citation
and removal of vehicles from private property in
the front yard, unfenced exterior and parkway
areas of the city. (Ord. 2718 § 1, 1998; Ord. 2670
§ 1, 1996; Ord. 1676 § 2, 1976).

10.84.020 Parking prohibited on portions of
private property.

No vehicle, vacation trailer, camping trailer,
boat, boat trailer, camper or recreational vehicle
may be parked or placed within the front yard or
exterior side yard (i.e., street side of a corner lot)
setback, except as follows:

A. In a garage or carport.

B. On a paved driveway.

C. On a dust-free area adjacent to a paved
driveway. “Adjacent” shall mean within 10 feet of
the edge of the driveway. (Refer to CVMC
19.62.150 for further limitations.) Note: “Dust-
free” shall mean grass or decomposed granite/pav-
ing per city standards adopted to accomplish a
dust-free surface.

D. When parking is not available under subsec-
tions (A) through (C) of this section, then consider-
ation shall be given by the zoning administrator to
select a parking area on the opposite side of the lot
or other appropriate locations on the property as
per CVMC 19.62.110. The applicant or other inter-
ested persons may appeal the decision of the zon-
ing administrator to the planning commission. The
appeal shall be filed in writing with the planning
department within 10 days of the administrator’s
action, and accompanied by the required appeal




10.84.030

fee(s). Appeals to the city council from the actions
of the planning commission shall follow the same
procedure.

Unmounted campers and camper shells may not
be placed in the front yard, driveway, or
unscreened (by solid six-foot-high fence or hedge)
exterior side yard setback area for a period of more
than 72 hours. (Ord. 2670 § 1, 1996; Ord. 2506 § 1,
1992; Ord. 2176 § 3, 1986; Ord. 1676 § 2, 1976).

10.84.030 Citation of vehicles parked in
prohibited areas.
Any police officer of the city of Chula Vista or
other employee with citation authority may cite a
-vehicle for a violation of CVMC 10.52.040 and
10.84.020; provided, however, a warning in the
form provided by the police department of the city
shall first be placed upon the vehicle. Seventy-two
(72) hours after the placement of such warning, the
citation may be issued. (Ord. 2670 § 1, 1996; Ord.
2176 § 4, 1986; Ord. 1676 § 2, 1976).

10.84.035 Citation authority.

The planning and building director, code
enforcement officers and other employees desig-
nated by the planning and building director shall
have the authority to enforce Chapters 10.52, 10.84
and 19.62 CVMC by issuing written notice of the
violation. (Ord. 2790, 1999; Ord. 2670 § 1, 1996;
Ord. 2176 § 4, 1986).

10.84.036 Notice of violation.
Repealed by Ord. 2718 §1, 1998. (Ord. 2670
§1,1996; Ord. 2176 § 4, 1986).

Chapter 10.86

PERMIT PARKING IN
RESIDENTIAL ZONES

Sections:
10.86.010
10.86.020

Purpose and intent.

Permit parking in excess of time
limitations.

10.86.030 Citation of permit vehicles.

10.86.010 Purpose and intent.

The purpose and intent of the city council in
adopting CVMC 10.86.010 through 10.86.030 is to
establish procedures for the issuance of-permits to
residential property owners or tenants to enable
such persons to park their vehicles in the street
adjacent to their homes for periods in excess of the
time limitation established for parking on such
streets. The city engineer shall maintain within a
register a Schedule XVTI listing all streets or por-
tions of streets that are designated for “Permit
Parking on Certain Residential Streets with Time
Limited Parking.” (Ord. 2670, 1996; Ord. 1904
§ 1, 1980).

10.86.020 Permit parking in excess of time
limitations. .
Any owner or tenant resident of property located
on a residential street which has time-limited park-
ing may obtain at no cost, by showing proof of res-
idence and vehicle registration at said address, a
permit from the city engineer which authorizes said
vehicle to be parked on residential streets, as desig-
nated on said permit, where a time limitation has
been imposed, in excess of said time limitation.
(Ord. 2670, 1996; Ord. 2638 § 1, 1995; Ord. 1904
§ 1, 1980).

10.86.030 Citation of permit vehicles.

Police officers or other persons charged with the
duty of enforcement of traffic regulations in the
city shall not issue citations to any vehicle display-
ing the authorized permit issued by the city engi-
neer regardless of the length of time that said
vehicle may be parked on any residential street on
which a two-hour parking time limitation has been
imposed; provided, however, such permits shall
not authorize parking in excess of the 72-hour lim-
itation as imposed by CVMC 10.52.100. (Ord.
2670, 1996; Ord. 1904 § 1, 1980).

10-46



Chula Vista Municipal Code

19.62.180

19.62.110 Limitation on areas to be used.

No part of any front yard or exterior side yard
(i.e., street side of a corner lot) shall be used for off-
street parking or access, except as noted in CVMC
10.84.020 and 19.62.150, unless so authorized by
the zoning administrator, pursuant to an approved
site plan. (Ord. 2743 § 3, 1998; Ord. 2176 § 6,
1986; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.801

®06)-

19.62.120 Parking areas — Lighting
arrangements.

Lighting used to illuminate any off-street park-
ing area shall be so arranged as to reflect the light
away from adjoining premises in any R zone. (Ord.
1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.801(F)(6)).

19.62.130 Waiver or modification of
provisions permitted when.

The commission may, by resolution, waive or
modify the provisions as herein set forth, establish-
ing required parking areas for such uses as electri-
cal power generating plants, electrical transformer
stations, utility or corporation storage yards or
other uses requiring a very limited number of per-
sons as compared to the number of persons
required by the usual industry of comparable size
expressed in square footage. (Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969;
prior code § 33.801(G)).

19.62.140 Off-street loading — Number and
size of spaces to be maintained.

A. For every building or part thereof having a
gross floor area of 10,000 square feet or more,
which is to be occupied by a commercial or indus-
trial use requiring the receipt of distribution by
vehicles of materials or merchandise, there shall be
provided and maintained, on the same lot with such
building, at least one off-street loading space plus
one additional such loading space for each addi-
tional 40,000 square feet or major fraction thereof.

B. Each loading space shall be not less than 10
feet in width, 25 feet in length, and 14 feet in height
clearance.

C. If such space occupies any part of any re-
quired yard or court spaces, it may not be located
closer than 50 feet to any lot in any R zone, unless
enclosed by a masonry wall not less than eight feet
in height. (Ord. 1212 §1, 1969; prior code
§ 33.802).

19.62.150 Residential parking — Front setback
restrictions — Generally.

No required parking spaces or required maneu-
vering area may be located in the front or exterior
setback area (except as noted in CVMC
10.84.020); the total combination of driveways and
adjacent parking areas shall not occupy more than
50 percent of the front or exterior side yard. (Ord.
2176 § 6, 1986; Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212
§ 1, 1969; prior code § 33.803(A)).

19.62.160 Residential parking — Front setback
restrictions — Exceptions.

In those cases where street improvements are at
their ultimate width, the front setback area, for
parking purposes, may be measured from the back
of the sidewalk. (Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212
§ 1, 1969; prior code § 33.803(B)).

19.62.170 Residential parking — Two-car
garage requirement — Intent and
purpose.

It is the intent of this section and CVMC
19.62.180 and 19.62.190 to require that all dwelling
units in the A, R-E, R-1 and R-2 zones as well as
single-family and two-family developments in the
P-C zone shall have constructed on the same lot, as
a necessary and essential accessory building to the
residential use of said lot, a two-car enclosed ga-
rage containing a minimum of 400 square feet and
minimum dimension of 20 feet. The purpose of said
requirement is to provide adequate off-street park-
ing so as to alleviate the congestion on residential
streets and space for the necessary storage of mate-
rials in an enclosure. The enclosed garage is neces-
sary to protect the general welfare of residential
areas by preventing the establishment of parking
spaces in an open parking lot situation inappropri-
ate to residential development and the open and dis-
orderly display of gardening equipment, tools,
boxes and other materials which would be stored in
enclosures to avoid an unsightly appearance. (Ord.
2151§ 1,1986;0rd. 1356 § 1,1971;Ord. 1212§ 1,
1969; prior code § 33.803(C)(1)).

19.62.180 Residential parking — Two-car
garage requirement — Garage
setbacks.

Notwithstanding requirements contained in this
chapter, minimum front yard shall be 22 feet from
the inside edge of the sidewalk to the door of a
garage or structure of a carport in the case of a
driveway approximately perpendicular to the front
property line. Any garage that has its access from

19-179



19.62.190

an alley shall be located 25 feet from the opposite
side of the alley with a minimum setback of five
feet from the alley. (Ord. 1336 § 1, 1971; Ord.
1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.803(C)(2)).

19.62.190 Residential parking —Procedure for
conversion to living purposes —
Approval required.

Prior to the issuance of a building permit for the
conversion of any existing garage or carport for
living purposes, the property owner desiring such
conversion shall be required to meet the following
conditions:

A. A new enclosed two-car garage as set forth

.in. CVMC 19.62.170 shall be provided to replace

the garage or carport being converted. Tandem
parking as provided in this chapter will not satisfy
the parking requirements.

B. All plans for the conversions of existing
garages or carports for living purposes, as well as
plans for new garages, shall be submitted to the
planning department for approval to insure that the
conversion is compatible in design and materials
with the existing dwelling. Plans for garage con-
versions shall show either:

1. The exterior of the garage unchanged; or

2. The exterior of the garage fully altered to
match the existing house elevation in colors, mate-
rials and trim.

C. A filing fee as set forth in the master fee
schedule shall accompany each application for a
garage conversion. (Ord. 2151 § 2, 1986; Ord. 2011
$1, 1982; Ord. 1669 § 1, 1976 Ord. 1356 § 1,
1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.803
(©3).

19.62.200 Enforcement of this chapter.

The planning and building director, code
enforcemant officers and other employees desig-
nated by the planning and building director shali
have the authority to enforce this chapter in accor-
dance with the procedures as set forth in Chapters
.40 and 1.41 CVMC. Any viclation of this chapter
shall constitute an infraction. and the administra-
sive citation provisions contained in Chapter 1.4!]
CVMC shall be applicable. (Ord. 2790, 1999; Ord.
2718 $ 1, 1998: Ord. 2176 § 7. 1956).

Chapter 19.64

NONCONFORNMING USES

Sections:

19.64.010 Declaration of policy.

19.64.020 Continuance of existing uses.

19.64.030 Completion of construction started
prior to certain date.

19.64.040 Existing conditional uses to be
considered nonconforming when.

19.64.050 Enlargement, extension or
reconstruction prohibited —
Exceptions.

19.64.060 Substitution or extension restrictions.

19.64.070 Cessation of use defined — Time
limits.

19.64.080 Uses subject to mandatory
discontinuance.

19.64.090 Timing of discontinuance — Generally.

19.64.110 Discontinuance of structures having
certain replacement value required —
Time limit.

19.64.120 Removal of other uses and structures
required — Notification — Time limits.

19.64.130 Uses not conforming to performance
standards — Time limit for
conformance.

19.64.140 Uses without conditional use permit or
subject to fence requirements — Time
limit for conformance.

19.64.150 Nonresidential structures —
Replacement restrictions.

19.64.155 Residential — Replacement permitted.

19.64.160 Modification of provisions permitted
when.

19.64.170 Repair or alterazion permitted when.

19.64.180 Uses not conforming to setback or
height requiremants — Alteration or
enlargement permitted when.

19.64.190 Recornstruction permits.

19.64.010 Declaration of policy.

Many nonconforming uses within the city are
detrimenta! to the orderly development of the city
and adverse to the general welfare of persons and
property, in that szid nonconforming uses consti-
tute a special benefis or monopoly. In conformance
with good zoning practices. it is the policy of the
city that nonconforming uses shall be eliminated as
soon as it 15 economically feasible and equitable to
do so. (Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969: prior code § 33.1101
(A).

19-180



19.58.330

motz than 60 lots may use up to 10 such lots for
mode! home purposes. Such temporary uses shall
be made only in conjunction with the sale or rental
of land or buildings within such subdivisions, and
such use or uses shall terminate two years after the
filing in the office of the county recorder of the final
subdivision map thereon, or 60 days after the sale
of the last house, whichever comes first. After the
time limit has expired, all commercial activity shall
cease and the temporary office building, if any,
shall be converted to a conforming use or removed
at the owner’s expense. At the termination of such
office use, all necessary alterations to convert the
temporary office to residential use or removal of
said building shall be made.

B. Ifalterations are needed in the initial conver-
sion from a house to a temporary office, the follow-
ing shall be done: a $250.00 penal bond shall be
filed with the city clerk to assure said work will be
completad. Upon a recommendation from the
director of planning and building or his authorized
deputy, he shall approve or reject the final alter-
ation work.

C. The zoning administrator shall determine the
need for off-street parking, based on the location of
model homes in relationship to adjoining subdivi-
sions, the size of the subdivision, the character of
the streat, and the expected duration of model home
area us2. (Ord. 2790, 1999; Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971;
Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.901(B)(32)).

19.58.330 Trailers.

(See definizion in CVMC 19.04.298))

A. Irisuniawful to use a camping trailer, motor
home, camper, or travel trailer for living or sleep-
ing purposes except when parked within a licensed
recreational vehicle park or mobilehome park, as
provided elsewhere in this title, or when used on a
temporary busis not to exceed a period of seven
days by guess or visitors of residents of the city
and said vehicle is parked upon the property of the
resident.

B. I:isunlawful to use a trailer, excluding com-
mercial couh units, as a business office in any
zone: except. that a general contractor and/or prop-
erty 0w ner or 12ssee may obtain atemporary permit
for the parkirz of one or more mobilehomes, motor
homes. campers or travel trailers for watchmen,
superyisory or other special personnel, or for use as
a temporary office at or immediately adjoining a
major construction site upon commencement of
such construction. Any such permit shall be issued
only by the director ofplanm z and building of the

city after an application, in writing, is submitted by
the general contractor specifying:

1. The number and type of such vehicles;

2. The reasons their presence is necessary at
the site at times other than normal work hours;

3. The period for which the permit is sought;

4. The vehicles for which a permit was
issued shall be removed from the premises 10 days
after final inspection.

C. Commercial coach units may be utilized for
a maximum of 235 percent of the total industrial
and/or commercial floor area available to a partic-
ular use; provided, that if visible from a public
street or from adjoining properties, the coach units
shall be made architecturally .compatible with and
complementary to the balance of the structures on
the same and adjacent sites.

D. Commercial coach units may be utilized as
temporary building space in conjunction with pub-
lic or quasi-public uses located in residential zones,
and in conjunction with public, quasi-public, and
private uses, such as banks, insurance offices, sav-
ings and loan institutions, public utility offices, and
similar public-service-based uses in commercial
and industrial zones; provided, that a conditional
use permit is procured for each commercial coach
so utilized. All conditional use permits granted for
the utilization of commercial coaches as temporary
building space shall be limited to a period of not
more than two years; provided, however, that the
permittee may apply to the planning commission
for an extension of time, which the commission
may grant for a maximum of one additional year.

E. A mobilehome, certified under the National
Mobile Home Construction and Safety Standards
Act of 1974 (USC Section 5401, et seq.), may be
placed on a permanent foundation on a private lot
in the A and R-1 zones and on lots designated for
single-family detached dwelling units in the P-C
zone; provided. that:

1. It may be occupied onlv as a residential
use;

2. All development standards of the underly-
ing zone pertaining to conventional single-family
development are compliad with; and

3 The foundation is in LO'ﬂPI “wce with all
applicable building regulations. (Ord. 2799, 1999:
Ord. 1941 §1.1981; Ord. 1711 §2, 19“6' Ord.
1518 § 1, 19 4:Ord. 1336 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212
31, 1969; prior code § 33 901[B 33))
19.58.340 Recycling and solid waste storage.

A. All subdivisions or any new construction
requiring a building permit and costing more than







Chula Vista Municipal Code

19.58.022

19.58.270 Retail sales tor guests only.
19.58.280 Service stations.
19.58.290 Shooting clubs.
19.58.310 Stables and corrals.
19.58.320 Tract office. temporary.
19.58.330 Trailers.
19.58.340 Recycling and solid waste storage.
19.58.345 Recycling collection centers.
19.58.350 Commercially zoned double frontage
lots.
9.58.360 Zoning wall or fence.
9.58.370 Outside sales and display — Permanent
and temporary.
19.58.330 Special events.
19.58.390 Senior housing development.
19.58.400 Recreational vehicle storage yards.
19.58.410 Prohibition of tlashing lights.
19.58.420 Water distribution facilities.

19.58.010 Purpose of provisions.

The purpose of these special provisions is to
establish clear and definite terms and conditions
governing the development of certain uses. pos-
sessing unique characteristics or problems. which
will enable diverse uses to be accommodated har-
moniously within the City. and to provide unitorm
standards and guidelines for such development.
(Ord. 1356 § 1. 1971: Ord. 1212 § 1. 1969: prior
code § 33.901(A)).

19.58.020 Accessory buildings.

A. An accessory building may be erected
detached from the principal building or. except
when a stable. may be erected as an integral part of
the principal building or it may be attached thereto
by a breezeway or similar structure.

B. Any accessory building attached to the main
building shall be made structurally a part of the
main building and shall comply inall respacts with
the requirements of this title applicable to the main
building. Unless attached. an accessory building in
an R zone shall be at least six feet from any dwell-
ing existing or under construction on the same lot
or anv adiacent lot. Except in the R-3-T zone. the
following shall apply:

I. No building may occupy any portion of a
required vard: except. that a detached gurage or
carport. coverad patio enclosed on not more than
two sides. or other accessory one-story building
may disregard any rear or side yard requirements if
located in the rear 30 percent of the ot or back of
the front 70 feet of the lot:

2. An aceessory building or coverad patio
located 70 teet or less from the front property line

shall have the same side yard as that required for
the main building, regardless of whether said
accessory building is detached from the main
building;

3. A covered patio, detached garage or car-
port. or other accessory one-story building. may
cover an area not to exceed 30 percent. except as
allowed for parking structures in multiple-family
zones (see CVMC 19.28.100). of the area of any
required rear yard; except. that no accessory build-
ing in a rear yard shall be required to have less than
400 square feet;

4. A covered patio or detached accessory
building located in the rear 30 percent of the lot. or
back of the front 70 feet-of the lot, shall be located
either on a property line or not less than three feet
trom such line.

C. All accessory buildings shall be considered
in the calculation of lot coverage; garden shelters,
greenhouses, storage shelters and covered patios
shall be permitted as accessory buildings; pro-
vided, that these uses are not equipped for use as
living quarters.

D. Guest house accessory buildings shall not be
closer than 10 feet to the nearest point of the main
building. (Ord. 2145 § 2. 1986: Ord. 2124 § 7.
1985; Ord. 1356 § 1. 1971: Ord. 1212 § L. 1969;
prior code § 33.901(B)(1)).

19.38.022  Accessory second dwelling units.

A. The purpose of this section is to provide reg-
ulations for the establishment of accessory second
dwelling units in compliance with California Gov-
ernment Code Section 65832.2. Said units may be
located in residential zone districts where adequate
public facilities and services are available. and
impacts upon the residential neighborhood directly
affected would be minimized. Accessory second
dwelling units are a potential source of affordable
housing and shall not be considered in any calcula-
tion of allowable density of the lot upon which they
are located. and shall also be deemead consistent
with the General Plan and zoning designation of
the lot as provided. Accessory second dwelling
units shall not be considerad a separate dwelling
unit for the purpose of subdividing the property
into individual condominium or lot ownership.

B. For the purposes of this section. the follow-
ing words are defined:

“Above” as used in this section means an acees-
sory second dwelling unit that is attached and built
over a primary residence including an attached

garage.

19-140.1

(Revisec 7:07)






19.58.150

6. The initial term of a certified farmers’
market use permit shall be for a period not to
exceed one year. Any extension or renewal of said
use permit must be heard and acted upon by the
city council, unless the city council expressly dele-
gates such authority to the planning commission.

D. Parking. A certified farmers’ market shall
provide customer parking at a ratio of one space
per 200 square feet of the maximum shoppmc7 area
proposed. The term “shopping area” includes the
area occupied by produce stands, vendor storage,
walkways and aisles. If adequate parking is not
available on-site, the operator shall provide off-site
parking within 300 feet of the market area as mea-

.sured along permanently available pedestrian
routes. Said off-site parking shall be clearly identi-
fied as parking for the farmers’ market, including
signs at the market directing patrons to the off-site
parking location.

E. If a certified farmers’ market is located in a
residential zone, it must be on property used prima-
rily for public or quasi-public uses.

F. Any other conditions of approval set forth in
the conditional use permit. (Ord. 2938 § 2, 2004).

19.58.150 Fences, walls and hedges.

A fence, wall or hedge subject to the provisions
of CVMC 12.12.120 and 12.12.130, not more than
three and one-half feet in height, may be main-
tained and located on any part of a lot. Those in
excess of three and one-half feet may be located as
tollows:

A. Afence, wall or hedge not more than six feet
in height may be maintained and located on any
part of an interior or corner lot, to the rear of the
required front and exterior side yard setbacks.

B. In any residential zone, a fence, wall or
hedge, not more than six feet in height, may be
maintained and located within a required exterior
side yard subjzct to approval of the zoning admin-
istrator, who shall consider adjacent driveways,
rraffic hazards and topographic differences. A
masonry wall shall consist of decorative features
and a fence shall be interspersed with masonry
pilasters, a maximum of 135 feet apart to insure a
pleasing and aesthetic effect to the adjacent areas.
Landscaping shall be required between the wall,
fence, or hedzz and the sidewalk if said wall, fence
or hedge is not locatad at the edge of a sidewalk.

C. Portions of fences or walls over six feet in
height, to enclose tennis courts or other game
areas, and located where six-foot fences are other-
wise permitted, shall be composed of wire mesh
capable of admitting at least 90 percent of available

light as measured on a light meter. Such fences
over six feet in height may be permitted subject to
approval of the zoning administrator based on a
finding that such fences will not constitute a nui-
sance to aburiing property.

D. In any commercial or industrial zone,
fences, walls or hedges may be allowed or required
to a maximum height of nine feet if it is determined
by the zoning administrator that said increase in
height is necessary to protect the public health,
safety or general welfare and would have no detri-
mental effect upon the surrounding neighborhood.
(Ord. 1356 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969 prior
code § 33.901(B)(14)).

19.58.160 Fertilizer plants and yards.

Fertilizer plants and yards shall be no closer than
200 feet to any residential district; shall provide
automobile parking and truck loading areas,
together with ingress and egress so designed as to
minimize traffic hazard and congestion; and shall
show that odor, dust, noise and drainage will not
constitute a nuisance to surrounding properties.
(Ord. 1336 § 1, 1971; Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior
code § 33.901(B)(13)).

19.58.170 Golf driving ranges.

Golf driving ranges shall be located only on
major or secondary thoroughfares except when
incidental to a golf course. Floodlights used to illu-
minate the premises shall be so directed and
shielded as rot to be an annoyance to any devel-
oped residential property. The golf driving plat-
form shall be not less than 200 feet from any
adjacent R zone. The driving area shall be planted
with grass, equipped with a >prmkler system, and
maintained in good condition at all times. (Ord.
1356 § 1, 1971; Ozd. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code
$33.901( B 16)).

19.58.175 Hay and feed stores.

Retail hav and 7=ad stores in A — agricultural
zone shall conform w the following:

A. Whenever a ‘13_\' and feed store is located

within 100 feerof any resv'dence not on the same lot
as the store, s7ora ge of hav and feed shall be totally
enclosed within the buil 1“10(3) and properly venti-
lated.

B. Storage of readily combustible materials
which excead 2 volume of 2,500 cubic feet shall be
permitted onl: upm approv al by the fire marshal.

C. Attheunm o7 filinz an application for a con-

ditional use ,erm . the ‘.pplicant shall show that
odor and dus: will not constitute a nuisance or haz-

(Revised 8/04)






Chula Vista Municipal Code

15.08.020

Chapter 15.08

BUILDING CODE*

Sections:
15.08.010 California Building Code, 2001
Edition adopted by reference.
Subsection 104.2.1 — General -
Amended to designate assistant
director of the building division as
building official.

Subsection 103.1 — Board of appeals
and advisors amended to confer
suitability of alternate materials
jurisdiction on board of appeals.
Exempted work — Subsection 106.2 is
amended to delete exemptions for
certain types of construction from the
requirement to obtain a building
permit.

Subsection 107.2 amended — Permit
fees.

Subsection 107.3 amended - Plan
review fees.

Repealed.

Subsection 108.1.2 added to Section
108.1 to authorize compliance survey
inspections.

Subsection 709.4.1 amended to add an
exception to the requirement for
parapets.

Subsection 904.2.1 amended to
require installation of automatic fire-
extinguishing system in buildings
greater than certain height.

Section 1503 amended to provide for
more restrictive roof coverings.
Subsection 1511.5 added to Section
15311 o require equipment enclosures
on roofs.

15.08.020

15.08.030

15.08.040

15.08.041
15.08.045
15.08.050
15.08.060

15.08.070

15.08.080

15.08.090

15.08.100

* For statutory provisions regarding the authority of cit-
ies to regulate the building, construction and removal
of buildings within the city, see Gov. Code § 38601;
for other provisions of the State Housing Act, see
Health and Safzty Code § 17910, et seq.

Prior legislation: Prior code §§ 8.1 and 8.3; Ords. 778,
1315, 1570, 1727, 1770, 1901, 2027, 2155, 234!
2439, 2506, 2307, 2539 and 2644

.15.08.010 California Building Code, 2001
Edition adopted by reference.
There is hereby adopted by reference the Cali-
fornia Building Code, known as the California

Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 2, and Appendix
Chapter 3, Division II; Appendix Chapter 15;
Appendix Chapter 31, Division Il and Division IIl
of that certain document as copyrigh:ed by the
International Conference of Building OcTicials and
the California Building Standards Commission.
Chapter 11, Accessibility, is hereby exempted. Said
document is hereby adopted as the building code of
the city of Chula Vista for regulating the erection,
construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, mov-
ing, demolition, conversion, occupancy, Use,
height, and area of all buildings and structures in
the city, and providing for the issuance of permits
and collection of fees therefor, and each and all
such regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions
and terms of the California Building Code, 2001
Edition, and Appendix Chapter 3, Division I
Appendix Chapter 15; Appendix Chapter 31, Divi-
sion II and Division III are herzsby referred to,
adopted, and made a part hereof as though fully set
forth herein, excepting such portions as are herein-
after deleted, modified, or amended. 1Ord. 2872
§ 1,2002; Ord. 2780-B § 1, 1999).

15.08.020 Subsection 104.2.1 — General -
Amended to designate assistant
director of the building division as
building official.

Subsection 104.2.1 of the California Building

Code, as it applies in the city of Chula Vista, is

hereby amended to read as follows:

Subsection 104.2.1 General. The Building
Official is hereby authorized and ¢ rected
to enforce all the provisions of this code.
For such purposes the Building Official
shall have the powers of a law enforczment

officer.

The Building Official sha' ha2 the power
to render interpretations cf th's codz and to
adopt and enforce rules a2nz reg. ations
supplemental to this cciz zs mzy be
deemed necessary in orZsr 10 cla-iy the
application of the provisizns cf this code.
Such intsroretations, rules an< reg.’ations
shall be in conformity wi~ 12 intznt and
purpose of this code. The 3u"'ding Official
shall be the Assistant Dirszi2- of thzs Build-

ing Division.

(Ord. 2872 §1,2002;0rd. 2732-B § L. 1999).

15-17

(= zvised 2/03)






15.08.030

15.08.030 Subsection 105.1 - Board of appeals
and advisors amended to confer
suitability of alternate materials
jurisdiction on board of appeals.

Subsection 105.1 of the California Building

Code, as it applies in the city of Chula Vista, is

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 105.1 Board of Appeals and Advi-
sors. To determine the suitability of alter-
nate materials, methods of construction
and to provide for reasonable interpreta-
tion of the provisions of this code, there
shall be and is hereby created a Board of
Appeals and Advisors consisting of seven
members who are qualified by experience
and training to pass upon matters pertain-
ing to building construction. The Building
Official shall be an ex-officio member who
shall not be entitled to vote and who shall
act as secretary to the Board. The Board of
Appeals and Advisors shall be appointed
by the Mayor and confirmed by the City
Council. The Board shall render all deci-
sions and findings in writing to the Building
Official with a duplicate copy to the appel-
lant. The decision of the Board is final. The
Board of Appeals and Advisors shall rec-
ommend to the City Council such new leg-
islation deemed necessary to govern con-
struction in the City of Chula Vista.

(Ord. 2872 § 1, 2002; Ord. 2780-B § 1, 1999).

15.08.040 Exempted work — Subsection 106.2
is amended to delete exemptions for
certain types of construction from
the requirement to obtain a building
permit.

Subsection 106.2 of the California Building
Code, as it applies in Chula Vista, shall read as fol-
lows:

Subsection 106.2 EXEN'PTED WORK. No

person, firm, or corpcration shall erect,

construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, im-

prove, remove, convert. or demolish any

building or structure in the city of Chula

Vista or cause the sam= to be done with-

out first obtaining a sepzrate building per-

mit for each such puilding or structure from
the Building Official exczaot as follows:

A. Fences up to seventy-two inches and
freestanding masonry walls up to forty-
eight inches in height above the highest
adjacent grade.

B. Detached patio covers, not exceeding
twelve feet in height, with a projected roof
area not to exceed one hundred forty-four
square feet and at least six feet from any
building or structure on the same property.

C. One-story detached accessory build-
ings, not exceeding twelve feet in height
used as tool and storage sheds, playhous-
es and similar uses, provided-the floor
area does not exceed one hundred forty-
four square feet and are located so as to
comply with the provisions of Chula Vista
Municipal Code, Section 19.58.020.

D. Oil derricks.

E. Movable cases, counters, and partitions
not over five feet, nine inches in height.

F. Retaining walls which are not over three
feet in height measured from the top of the
footing to the top of the wall, unless sup-
porting a surcharge or impounding flam-
mable liquids.

G. Television and radio antennas less than
thirty-five feet in height.

H. Awnings projecting not more than fifty-
fourinches and attached to, and supported
by, the exterior walls of buildings of Group
R-3, Division 3 or U Occupancy.

|. Platforms, walks and driveways not more
than thirty inches above grade and not
over any basement or story below.

J. Temporary motion picture, television
and theater stage sets and scenery.

K. Prefabricated swimming pools accesso-
ry to a Group R, Division 3 Occupancy in
which the pool walls are entirely above the
adjacent grade and if the capacity does not
exceed five thousand gallons.

L. Fish ponds, reflective pools or other
decorative water containers with a wet sur-

(Revised 2/03)



Chula Vista Municipal Code

15.08.060

faca area of one hundred square feet or
less and a maximum depth of eighteen
inches to the flood rim.

M. Repairs which involve only the replace-
meant of component parts of existing work
with similar materials for the purpose of
maintenance, and which do not aggregate
over $500.00 in valuation in any twelve-
month period, and do not affect any electri-
cal, plumbing or mechanical installations.
Repairs exempt from permit requirements
shall not include any addition, change, or
modification in construction, exit facilities,
or cermanent fixtures or equipment.

Specifically exempted from permit require-
ments without limit to valuation are:

1. Painting, papering, decorating and sim-
ilar work.

2. Installation of floor covering.
3. Cabinet work.

4. Outside paving of R-3 and U Occupan-
cies parking surfaces. (CCR Title 24 Dis-
ablad Access Required.)

5. Rs-roofing buildings of Group R and U
Occupancies of less than five hundred
square feet or less than fifty percent of roof
covering replacement.

This saction shall not be construed to re-
quirs separate building permits for dwell-
ings and accessory buildings or structures
on na same property which are described
in t~= building permit application, plot plan
and other drawings.

Exs=otion from the permit requirements of
ths code shall not be deemed to grant au-

tho-zation for any work to be done in any -

mz~nerin violation of the provisions of this
cczs or any other laws or ordinances of
the city of Chula Vista.

(Ord. 2372 § 1, 2002; Ord. 2780-B § 1, 1999).

15.08.041 Subsection 107.2 amended — Permit
fees.
Subsection 107.2 of the California Building
Code is amended to read as follows:

Subsection 107.2 Permit Fees. Permit
fees shall be as specified in the Master
Fee Schedule of the City of Chula Vista.

(Ord. 2872 § 1, 2002).

15.08.045 Subsection 107.3 amended — Plan
review fees.
Subsection 107.3 of the California Building
Code is amended to read-as follows:

Subsection 107.3 Plan Review Fees.
When a plan or other data are required to
be submitted by Subsection 106.3.2, a
plan review fee shall be paid at the time of
submitting plans and specifications for re-
view. Said plan review shall be as speci-
fied in the Master Fee Schedule.

(Ord. 2872 § 1, 2002; Ord. 2831-A § 4, 2001).

15.08.050 Section 107 amended by adding
subsection 107.7, Exceptions,
waiving fees for government
entities, and subsection 107.8,
Retention of plans, to charge fees
not contained in the UBC.

Repealed by Ord. 2872 § 1, 2002. (Ord. 2780-B

§ 1. 1999).

15.08.060 Subsection 108.1.2 added to Section
108.1 to authorize compliance
survey inspections.

Subsection 108.1.2 is hereby added to Section
108.1 of the California Building Code, as it applies
in Chula Vista. and said subsection shall read as
follows:

Subsection 108.1.2 Compliance Survey
Inspection. Upcn receipt of a written re-
quest for a compliance survey from the
owner and payment of the fee specified in
the Master Fee Schedule, the Building Of-
ficial may inspect an existing structure to
ascertain its compliance with the provi-
sions of this code and other applicable

(Revised 2/03)



Ccoccrrreorrrrrrrecrrrrorereeet

0> 0%>03030> 0303 0»0> 020> 03»0>0>0

2C01 CALIFORMIA BUILDING CCCE

hereby craatad a board of appe2’s consisting of members who are
qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertainigg
to building construction and who are not employees of the juris-
diction. The building official shal be an ex officio member ofand
shall act as secretary to said beard but shall have no vote on any
matter befors the board. The beard of appeals shall be appointed
by the governing body and sha!l hold office at its pleasure. The
board shall adopt rules of proczdure for conducting its business,
and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appel-
lant with a duplicate copy to the building official.

105.1.1 [For SFM] Right to Appeal. For clarification pur-
poses, the applicable subsection of the Health and Safety Code
section is repeated. e ’

Section 18945. (a) Any persor: adversely affected by any regu-
lation, rules, omission, interprezation, decision or practice of any
state agency, respecting the administration of any building stan-

-dard may appeal the issue for resolution to the Commission.

(b) Ifany local agency having authority to enforce a state build-
ing standard and any person ad~ersely affected by any regulation,
rule, omission, interpretation, dzcision or practice of such agency
respecting such building standard both wish to appeal the issue
for resolution to the commission, then both parties may appeal to
the commission. The commission may accept such appeal only if
the commission determines that the issues involved in such appeal
have statewide significance.

105.2 Limitations of Authority. The board of apgeals shall
have no authority relative to interpretation of the administrative

provisions of this code nor shall :he board be empowered to waive
requirements of this code.

SECTION 106 — PERMITS

106.1 Permits Required. Exceptas specified in Section 106.2,
no building or structure regulazad by this code shall be erected,
constructed, enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, re-
moved, converted or demalishe2 unless a separate permit foreach
building or structure has first be2n obtained from the building offi-
cial.

106.2 Work Exempt from Permit. A building permit shall not
be rzquired for the following:

buildings used as tool and

nilar uses, previdad the fleor
=5

t(11.15 m~).

1. Cre-story detached accassory

storags sheds, playhouses, and si
arza does not excesd 120 squars

ool
1

T
faa

O

2 Fances not over 6 fest (1329 mm) high.
. Oil derricks.

4. Movable cases, counters and paritions rot
9 inches (1753 mm) high.

L)

over 5 fzet

3. Reta ciover £ 722t (1219 mm) in height
measurad from the bottom of the Zooting tc the top of the wall, un-
less supporting a surchargs or impounding Class [, lTer III-A lig-
uids.

dees natexceed 3,000 gallens (
diama:zar or width does net exc

7. Platforms, walks and drivaway

s rot more than 30 inche
(762 mm) above grade and nct cverany dasems

atarstory below.
8. Painting, papering and similar finish work.

9. Temporary motion picturs. tzlevision and theater stage sets
and scznery.

10S.1
106.3.3

10. Window awaings supported by anex:zriorwallof GroupR,
Division 3, and Group U Occupancies when projecting not more
than 54 inches (1372 mm).

11. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R, Di-
vision 3 Occupancy in which the pool walls arz entirely above the
adjacent grade and if the capacity does not 2xcesd 5,000 gallons
(189271L).

12. [For SFM] State-owred buildings under the jurisdiction
of the state fire marshal.

Unless otherwise exempted, separate plumbing, electrical and
mechanical permits will be required for the above-exempted
items.

Exemption from the permit requirements of this code shall not
be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any
manner in violation of the provisions of this code orany otherlaws
or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

106.3 Application for Pefn‘:li‘t.

1063.1 Application. To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first
file an application therefor in writing on a form furnished by the
code enforcement agency for that purpose. Every such application
shall:

1. Identify and dascribe the work to be covered by the permit
for which application is made.

2. Describe the land on which the proposed work is to be done A

by legal descripticn, street address or similar description that will
readily identify ard definitely locate the proposed building or
work.

3. Indicate the use or occupancy for which the proposed work is
intended.

4. Be accompanied by plans, diagrams, computations and
specifications and other data as required in Section 106.3.2.

5. State the valuation of any new building or structure or any
addition, remodeling or alteration to an existing building.

6. Be signed by the applicant, or the applicant’s authorized
agent.

7. Give such other data and information as may be required by
the building official.

106.3.2 Submittal documents. Plans, sgecifications, engineer-
ing calculations, diagrams, soil investigation reports, special in-
spection and structural observation programs and other data shall
constitute the submittal documents and shall be submitted in one
or more sets with 2ach application for a permit. When such plans
are not prepared by an architect or enginesr, the building official
may require the aprlicant submitting such plans or other data to
demonstrate that sizte law does not require that the plans be pre-
parsd by a licensed architect or enginesr. The building official
may require plans, computaticns and specifications to be prepared
and designed by aa snginesr or architect licansed by the state to
practics as such evan if not required by staze law.

EXCEPTION: Tae building oficial may waive the submission of
olans, calculations, constructicn inspectica requirsments and other
data if it is found that the nature of the werk applied for is such thatre-
viewing of alars is not necessary to obtain compliance with this code.

106.3.3 Information on plans and specifications. Plans and
pecifications shall be drawn to scale upen substantial paper or
cloth and shall be o7 sufficient clacity o indicate the lecation, na-
turs and extent of the work propesad and show in detail that it wi}l
conform to the provisions of this cods and 2!l relevant laws, ordi-
nances, rules and regulations.
Plans for buildings of other than Group R. Division 3and Group
U Occupancies shall indicate how requirzd structural and fire-

1-6.5

[g¥ ]

[l i ol



!“r“l’"(“l“r“r‘(‘l‘I‘r"r“l‘(‘t‘(‘l‘r‘r“l‘r‘l(llllll‘lnl((((lxlll(:l(ll(llllll(l(ll((ll(llllllnxxx((lllll(l(llllltllllllll||llll(‘l"r‘.

FOPOFOFOrOr0OFOFOrOFOFOFAFOPOFOXOEOFOFOFOFOFOFOFOFOAFOPFOFOFOFOXOXOFO»OP0FOFAPO>OPOFO>0P 0> 030> 0P0F0P 00> 02 NF 020

106.3.3
106.4.1

resistive integrity will be maintained whers penetrations will be
made for electrical, mechanical, plumbing and commuricaticn
conduits, pipes and similar systems.

106.3.3.1 [For SFM] Public schools. Plans and specifications
for the construction, alteration or addition to any building owned,
leased or rented by any public school district shall be submitted to
the Division of the State Architect, Office of Regulation Services
for review and approval.

EXCEPTION: Upontheannualsubmissionofawritter. requestby
the chief of any city, county, or city and county fire department or fire-
protectiondistrict to the Divisionof the State Architect, Officz of Regu-
lationServices, approvals required by this subsectionshall be obtaired
from the appropriate chief or his or her authorized representative. In
such instances plans ard specifications may be submitted io the state
firemarskal for relay to the appropriate local authority or may be sub-
mitted directly to such local authority.

106.3.3.2 [For SFM] Movable walls and partitions. Plans or
diagrams shall be submitted to the enforcing agency for approval
before the installation of, or rearrangement of, any movable wall
or partition in any occupancy. Approval shall be granted only if
there is no increase in the fire hazard.

106.3.3.3 [For SFM] New construction high-rise buildings.
1. Complete plans or specifications, or both, sha!l be prepared
covering all work required to comply with new construction high-
rise buildings. Such plans and specifications shall be submitted to
the enforcing agency having jurisdiction.

2. All plans and specifications shall be prepared urder the re-
sponsible charge of an architect or a civil or structural engineer
authorized by law to develop construction plans and specifica-
tiorns, or by both such architect and engineer. Plans and specifica-
tions shall be prepared by an engineer duly qualified in that
branch of engincering necessary to performsuch services. Admin-
istration of the work of construction shall be under the ckarge of
the responsible architect or engineer except that where plans and
specifications involve alterations or repairs, such work of con-
struction may be administered by an engineer duly qualijied to
perform such services and holding a valid certificate urdzr Chap-
ter 7 (commencing with Section 65700) of Division 3 of the
Business and Professions Code for performance of services inthat
branch ofenginzering in which said plans, specifications and esti-
mates and work of construction are applicable.

This section shall not be construed as preventing the dzsign of
fire-extinguiskirg systems by persons holding a C-16 license is-
sued pursuantto Division 3, Chapter 9, Business and Pro‘essions
Code. In such instances, kowever, the resporsibility chargz of this
section shall prevail.

106.3.3.4 [For SFM] Existing high-rise buildings. 1. Com-
plete plans or specificatiors, or both, shall be prepared covering
all work required by Sections 403.11 through 403.25, Title 24,
California Codz of Regulations, or existing high-rise buildings.
Such plans or specifications shall be submirted to the erforcirg
agency having jurisdiction.

2. When new construction is required to corform with :r:¢ pro-
visiors of thesz regulatiors, complete plans or specificatiors, or
both, shall be prepared in accordance with the provisiors of this
subsection. As used in this szction “new construction” is not in-
tended to include repairs, replacements or miror altzratiors
which do not disrupt or apzreciably add to or affect the structural
aspects of the building.

106.3.4 Architect or engineer of record.

106.3.4.1 General. When it is required that documents b= pre-
pared by anarchitect or enginezr, the building official may requirs
the owner to engage and designate on the building permitagplica-

1-6.6

2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

tion an architect or engineer who shall act as thz architect cr 2ngi-
nesr of record. If the circumstances require, the ownzr may
designate a substitute architect or engineer of record who shall
perform all of the duties required of the original architect crengi-
neer of rzcord. The building official shall be notified in writing by
the owner if the architect or engineer of record is changed ¢r is un-
able to continue to perform the duties.

The architect or engineer of record shall ba responsiblz for re-
viewing and coordinating all submittal documents prepzrad by
others, including deferred submittal itzms, for compatibility with
the design of the building. -7

106.3.4.2 Deferred submittals. Forthe purposes of this szction,
deferred submittals are defined as those portions of the design that
are not submitted at the time of the application and that ars to be
submitted to the building official within a specified pericd.

/ Deferral of any submittal items shall have prior approval of the
building official. The architect or engineer of record shall list the
defzerrad submittals on the plans and shall submit the deferr=d sub-
mittal documents for review by the building official.

Submittal documents for deferred submittal items shall be sub-
mitted to the architect orengineer of record who shall review them
and forward them to the building official with a notation indicat-
ing that the deferred submittal documents have been reviewsd and
that they have been found to be in general conformance with the
design of the building. The deferred submittal items shall not be
installed until their design and submittal documents have besnap-
proved by the building official.

106.3.5 Inspection and observation program. When special
inspection is required by Section 1701, the architect orenginzerof
record shall prepare an inspection program that shall be submitted
to the building official-for approval prior to issuance of the build-
ing permit. The inspection program shall designate the porzions of
the work that require special inspection and the name or names of
the individuals or firms who are to perform the special inspec-
tions, and indicate the duties of the special inspectors.

The special inspector shall be employed by the owner, the engi-
neer or architect of record, or an agent of th2 owner, but rot the
contrac:or or any other person responsible fer the work.

When structural observation is required by Section 1702. the in-
specticn program shall name the individuals or firms who are to
perform structural observation and descrbe the stagss of
construction at which structural observation is to occur.

The inspection program shall include samples of inspection re-
ports and provide time limits for submission of reports.

106.4 Permits Issuance.

106.4.1 Issuance. The application, plans, specifications. com-
putations and other data filed by an agplicant fora permitshall be
raviewsd by the building official. Such plans may [for SFM] skall
be reviewed by other departments of this jurisdiction in zccor-
darce with state law, Health and Safery Codz Section 13146, in
occuparcies regulated by the State Fire Marshal in order to verify
compliance with any applicable laws under their jurisdic:icn. If
the buiiding official finds that the work descrided inan application
fora psrmitand the plans, specifications and otherdata filed there-
with conform to the requirements of this codz and other pertineat
laws and ordinances, and that the fa2s specified in Secticn 107
have bezn paid, the building official shall issus a permit therzorto
thz apglicant.

When the building official issues the permit where plans are re-
quirzd, the building official shall enderse in writing or stamp the
plans and specifications APPROVED. Such approved plas and
specifications shall not be changed. medifizd or altered without

[grderd ek el

alalalalalel]



030> 0

2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

authorizations from the building official, and all work regulated
by this code shall be done in accordance with the approved plans.

The building official may issue a permit for the construction of
partof a building or structure before the entire plans and specifica-
tions for the whole building or structure have been submitted or
approved, provided adequate information and detailed statements
have been filed complying with all pertinent requirements of this
code. The holder of a partial permit shall proceed without assur-
ance that the permit for the entire building or structure will be
granted.

106.4.2 Retention of plans. One set of approved plans, specifi-
cations and computations shall be retained by the building official
for a period of not less than 90 days from date of completion of the
work covered therein; and one setof approved plans and specifica-
tions shall be returned to the applicant, and said set shall be kepton
the site of the building or work at all times during which the work
authorized thereby is in progress.

106.4.2.1 [For HCD 1] Retention of plans.

NOTE: ReferenceBuilding Standards Law, Healthand Safety Code,
Sections 19850 and 19851, for provisions related to permanent reten-
tion of plans.

106.4.3 Validity of permit. The issuance or granting of a permit
or approval of plans, specifications and computations shall not be
construed to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any

of the provisions of this code or of any other ordinance of the juris-.

diction. Permits presuming to give authority to violate or cancel
the provisions of this code or other ordinances of the jurisdiction
shall not be valid.

The issuance of a permit based on plans, specifications and oth-
er data shall not prevent the building official from thereafter re-
quiring the correction of errors in said plans, specifications and
other data, or from preventirg building operations being carried
on thereunder when in violation of this code or of any other ordi-
nances of this jurisdiction.

106.4.4 Expiration. Every permitissued by the building official
under the provisions of this codz shall expire by limitation and be-
come nulland void if the building or work authorized by such per-
mit is not commenced within 180 days from the date of such
permit, orif the building or work authorized by such permit s sus-
pended orabandoned at any time after the work is commenced for
a period of 180 days. Before such work can be recommenced, a
new permit shall be first obtainad to do so, and the fee therzfor
shall be one half the amount required for a new permit for such
work, provided no changss have been made orwill be made in the
original plans and specificaticns for such work. and providad fur-
ther that such suspension or atandonment has not exceeded one
year. In order to renew action on a permit after expiration. the per-
mittee shall pay a new full permit fea.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may appiy for an
extension of the time within which work may commencs under
that permit when the permites is unable to commence work with-
in the time required by this section for good and satistactory rza-
sons. The building official mav extend the time for action by the
permittee for a period not excz2ding 130 days cn written raquast
by the permittes showing thatcircumstances bevond the controlof
the permittee have preveniad action from being taken. No
shall be extended mors than once.

cermit

106.4.5 Suspension or revocation. The building otficial may,
in writing, suspend or revoke a permit issued under the provisions
of this code wheneverthe permitisissued inerrororonthe basis of
incorrect information supplied. or in viclation ot any ordinancs or
regulation or any of the provisions of this codz.

SECTION 107 — FEES AND PLAN REVIEW

107.1 General. Fees shall be assessed in accordance with the
provisions of this section or shall be as set forth in the fe2 schedule
adoptad by the jurisdiction.

107.1.1 [For HCD 1] General. Subject to other laws, reference
State Housing Law, Healt): and Safety Code, Division 13, Part1.5,
Section 17951 and California Code of Regulations, Title 25, Divi-
sion 1, Chapter 1 commencing with Section I for the localenforce-
ment agency’s authority to prescribe fees.

107.1.2 [For HCD 1] Plan review and time limitations. Subject
to other provisions of law, provisions related to plan checking,
prohibition of excessive delays and contracting with or employ-
ment of private parties to perform plan checking are set forth in
State Housing Law, Health and Safety Code, Section 17960.1 and
for employee housing, Health and Safety Code Sections 17021
and 17055. . .

107.2 Permit Fees. The fee for each permit shall be as set forth
in Table 1-A.

The determination of value or valuation under any of the provi-
sions of this code shall be made by the building official. The value
to be used in computing the building permit and building plan re-
view fees shall be the total value of all construction work for which
the permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting, roofing,
electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, elevators, fire-
extinguishing systems and any other permanent equipment.

107.3 Plan Review Fees. When submittal documents are re-
quired by Section 106.3.2, a plan review fee shall be paid at the
time of submitting the submittal documents for plan review. Said
plan review fee shall be 63 percent of the building permit fee as
shown in Table 1-A.

The plan review fees specified {n this section are separate fees
from the permit fees specified in Section 107.2 and are in addition
to the permit fees.

When submittal documents are incomplete or changsd se as to
require additional plan review or when the project involves de-
ferrsd submittal items as defined in Section 106.3.4.2, an addi-
tional plan review fee shall be charged at the rate shown in Table
1-A.

107.4 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no
permit is issued within 180 days following the date of application
shall-expire by limitation, and plans and other data submit:ed for
review may thereafter be raturned to the applicant or dasizcyed by
the building official. The building official may extend the time for
acticn by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days cn re-
quest by the applicant showing that circumstances bevond the
control of the applicant have prevented action from bzing taken.
No agplication shall be ex:ended more than once. In ordzr to re-
new action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall
resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fe2

,_.
(==
2
vl

5 Investigation Fees: Work without a Permit.
107.5.1 Investigation. Whenever any work for which a permit
equirad by this code has besn commenced without firstcbtain-

107.5.2 Fee. Aninvestigation fes, in addition to the parmit fee,
s 2 collected whether or not a permit is then or subsegquently
investigation fz2 shall be equal to the amount of the
e required by this code. The minimum investigation fe2
2 the same as the minimum fee set forth in Table 1-A. The
nt ot such investigation fee shall not exempt any person
ompliance with all other provisions of this cods nor from
nalty prescribed by law.

1-6.7

»0

202 0POPO>OAPXOF0»OPXO»N






FOFOFOF0X0F0FOFO0FOFOFOFOFOFOF0F0F0F0F0FOFOF0FOF0F0OX 00X OFOF0F R0 0F0F0F0F0F0F0>»0AF0XN>0F0F0>»N3020

107.6
108.3

107.6 FeeRefunds. Thebuilding official may autherizz rafund-
ing of any fe= paid harzundzr which was erronsously paid or
callected.

The building official may authorze refunding of n
80 percert of the permit f22 paid when no work has b
der a permit issued in accordancs with this cede.

ot mare than
e:zndoneun-

The building official may authorize refunding of nct more than
80 perceat of the plan review fee paid when an application fora
permit for which a plaa review fes has been paid is withdrawn or
canceled before any plan reviewing is done.

The building official shall not authorize refunding of any fee
paid except on written application filed by the original permittee
not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

107.6.1 [For SFM] Other fees. Pursuant to Health and Safety
Code Section 13146.2, a city, county or district which inspects a
hotel, motel, lodging house, or apartment house may charge and
collecta fee for the inspection from the owner of the structure inan
amount, as determined by the city, county or district, sufiicient to
pay its costs of that inspection. —

Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 1597.46, Large
Family Day-care Homes, the local government shall process any
required permit as economically as possible, and fees charged for
review shall not exceed the costs of the review and permit process.

Pursuant to Health and Safzty Code Section 13217, High-rise
Structure Inspection: Fees and Costs, a local agerncy which in-
spects a high-rise structure pursuant to Health and Safety Code
Section 13217 may charge ard collect a fee for the inspection from
the owner of the high-rise structure in an amount, as dztermined
by the local agency, sufficient to pay its costs of that irspection.

Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13235, FireClear-
ance Preinspection, fee; uporn receipt of a request from a prospec-
tive licensee of a community care facility, as defired in Section
1502, of a residantial-care facility for the glderly, as defined in
Section 1569.2, or of a child day-care facility, as defined in Sec-
tion 1596.750, the local fire enforcing agency, as defined in Sec-
tion 13244, or state fire marskal, whichever kas primary
Jjurisdiction, skall conduct a preinspection of the faciiizs prior to
the final fire clearance approval. At the time of the preinspection,
the primary fire enforcing agency shall price consultazior and in-
terpretation of the firesafzry regulazions, and shall rctiy the pro-
spective licensee of the facility in writing of the specific firescfety
regulations which shall be enforced in order to obtain fire clear-
ance approval A fee of not mere than $50.00 may te chargezd for
the preirspection of a facility with a capacity to serve 23 or fewer
persons. A fee of rot more than $100.00 may be chargzd jor apre-
inspection of a facilicy with a capacizy toserve 26 or more 2€rsorns.

The primary fire ernforcing agency shall co‘mp!e!e the final fire
clezrance inspection for a communicy care facility, re<i d
zre faciiity for the elderly, or child day-care faciliy w
30 days of receipt ofthe reques: for the final inspection, or as of the
daiz the prospective facility reguacss the final prelicensurez inspec-
tion by thz State Desartment of Social Services, whichever is later.

Pursucnt to Health and Scfery Code Section 13233, a prein-
spection fez of not more than 530 mey be charged for 2 Grouo R,

Division 2 facifity with 2 capacity o serve 25 or less cliznis A fee
of not more than 3100 may e chargzd for a preinsczciion of a

facility with a capacizy to serve 25 or more clients.

Pursuant to Health and Sefery Code Section 13131.5, a reason-
ablz finalinspection fee, notto 2xczed the actual cost of inspzction
services recassary to completz a final inspection may te charged
for Group R, Division 2.1 Occupcncies classified as residential

care facilities for the elderly (RCFE).

1-8.3

2001 CALIFZHNIA EUILD

-

{G CCDE

Pursuant to Health and Safety Cocz Szctior 1569.84, neither
the statz fire marshal nor any local putlic entity shall chargz any
fee for erforcing fire inspection regulations pursuant to state law
or regulation or local ordinance, with rzspect to residential-care
facilities for the elderly which service six or fewer persons.

Wherever a local authority having jurisdiction requests thatthe
statz fire marshal perform plan review ardlor irspection services
related to a building permit, the applicatle fees for such shall be
payable to the Office of the State Fire Marshal

SECTION 108 — INSPECTIONS

108.1 General. All construction or work for which a permit is
required shall be subject to inspection by the building official and
all such construction or work shall remain accessible and exposed

for inspection purposes until appraved by the building official. In

‘addition, certain typés of construction shall have continuous in
spection, as specified in Section 1701.5. =™ ‘

Approvalasa result of an inspection shall not be construed tobe

an approval of a violation of the provisions of this code or of other
ordinances of the jurisdiction. Inspections presuming to give au-

thority to violate or cancel the provisions of this code or of other °

ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not bz valid.

. It shall be the duty of the permit applicantlo cause the work to ’

remain accessible and exposed for insgection purposes. Neither
the building official nor the jurisdiction shall be liable forexpense
entailed in the removal or replacement of any material required to
allow inspection. '

A survey of the lot may be required by the building official to
verify that the structure is located in accordance with the approved
plans. .

108.1.1 [HCD 1] Excavation and grading. Sukjectto otker pro-
visions of law, reference Health and Safzry Codz, Sections 17953,
17954, 17955, and California Code of Rzzulatiors, Title 25, Divi-
sion 1, Chapter 1 commencing with Section 1 arnd Title 24, Part?2,
Apperdix Chapter 33, Excavation and Grading commencing with
Sec:tion 3304. :

108.2 Inspection Record Card. Work requiring a permit shall
not 5e commeaced until the permit holder oran agentof the permit
holder shall have posted or otherwise made available an inspec-
tion record card such as to allow the building cfficial to conve-
nizatly maks the required entries therecn regarding inspecticn of
the wark. This card shall be maintained available by the permit
holder until final approval has besn graatsd by the building
otficial. : .

duty of the person do-

1083 InspectionRequests. Itshallte:haduiv o
h2 building official

ing the work authorizad by a permit to actify th
that such work is ready for inspection. Tae building official may
reguirs that every request for inspecticn te filed at least one work-
ing day before such inspection is d2sired. Such request may bein
writing or by telephone at the option cf the building official.

It shall be the duty of the person reguasting any insgections re-
quired by this cade to providz access to 2
of such work.

108.4 Approval Required. Woerk shal
pointindicated in each successive ins
ing tha approval of the building o
upcn netification, shall make the requ

ither indicate that portion of the coas:ructien is satisfactory as
completed, or shall natify the permit heldaror an agentof the per-
mit helder wherein the same fails to comply with this code. Aay
portions that do not comply shall b2 comacted and such portion

L

shall not bz coverad or concealed until 2utherizad by the building

afficial.

> O>0»0»0>N0»00000

0>NX0>0»0»0

crorrrrrrrrrrrrrT

r"r‘l‘r'r‘r‘r‘vAr‘r‘

~



L C

(o]
A
(o]
A
c

cerre

{
~.
l‘!"l"‘

L
L

LCI
L A

coerrerr

Cc
A
Cc
A
C
A
C

[aialaiaiaiaialal
00303030

crrer

Cc
A
C
rY
Cc

C

~r=

2CQ1 CALIFORNIA SBUILDING CQOD=

_Thers shall be a final inspaction and approval of all buildings
and structures when ca‘.ApIet.d and -ady for occupancy 2nd use

108.5 Required Inspections.

108.5.1 [For HCD 1] General. Reinforcing stz2! or structural
* framework of any part of any building or structurs shall not be
covered or concealad without first obtaining the approval of the
building official.

Protection of joints and penetrauons in fire-resistive assemblies
shall not be concealed from view until inspected and approved.

The enforcing agency, upon notification, shall make the inspec-
tions prescribed by Sections 108.5.2, 108.5.3, 108.5.4, 108.5.5,
108.5.6 and 108.6.

c 108.5.2 [For HCD 1] Foundation mspm:txon. Inspection shall

& be made after excavations for footings is complete and any re- "
* quired reinforcing ste2l is in place. For concrete foundations, any . .
r»qumd forms shall be in place prior to inspection. All matedals -
¢ forthe foundation shall be on the job site; however, where concrete’

is ready mixed in accordance with approved nationally rscog-
nized standards, the concrete ne=d not be on the job site. Whe etha
foundation is to be constructed of approved treated woad, addi-
tional inspections may be required by the building official.

108.53 [For HCD 1] Concrete slab or under-floor inspection.
Inspection shall be made after all in-slab or under-floor reinforc-
irg steel building service equlpment conduit, piping acc:sson*s
and other ancillary equipment items are installed, but befcrs any
concrete is placed or floor sheathing installed, including the sub-
floor.

108.5.4 [For HCD 1] Frame inspection. Inspection shall be

made after the roof, roof deck or sheathing, allframing, firs block-
ing and bracing are in place and all cordu plumbir pipes,
c‘nmns’/s and vents to be concealed are comp1°t= and the rough
electrical, plumbing, and heating wires, conduits, plumbirz pipes
and ducts are approved.

8.5.5 [For HCD 1] Lath or gypsum board inspection. [n-
spec::on shallbe made afterall lathing and gypsum beard, intericr
and extarior, are in place, but beforz any plastering is apglied or
befors gypsum boardjon.ts and fasteners are tard and finished.

108.5.6 [For HCD 1] Final mspectxon. Inspecrion srzll be
* made afer finish grading and the building is completed and ready
for occupancy.

108.6 Special Inspections. For
17.

special inspections, se2 Chapter

108.7 -Other Inspections. In additicn to the called inspections
specified above, the building official may make or requirs other
L.spe-:ions ofafxy constructicn work to ascertaincompliancs with
the provisions of this code and cther laws which are enfarzed by

.

the cod: enforcement agency

n f22 may be assassad for
asu c‘l porticn of weark for
2 or whan comactions

108.8 Reinspections. A rein
each inspection or reinsgectio
which inspection is called is
cailed for are not mada.

Tais section is not to be {ntarpreted as re quiring reinscaction
fz2s the first time aJco is rejectad for failure 10 compiy with the
requiramantsof this cad:,but asconie Iing the practicz of calling
for inspections befara the job is ready for such inspection or re-
inspection

ss2ssad when the "‘s:s::'"" szcord

Rainspection fe2s may be a
herwisa available on the work sizz, the

card is not postad or oth

1C3.4
109.5

approved plans are not readily available to the insz2ctor, for fail-

= to provids accass on the date for which inspectica isrequested,
or for deviating from plans requiring the approvai ¢ the building
official.

To obtain a rzinspection, the applicant shall fils 21 application
thereforin writing ona form furnished for that purgcsz and pay the
reinspection {22 in accordance with Table 1-Acrassatforthin the
fa= schedule adopted by the jurisdiction.

In instances where reinspection fees have bezn a.ssess.d no
additional inspection of the work will be perform=d until the re-
quired fees have been paid. -

SECTION 108 — CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY
109.1 Use and Occupancy. No building or structure shall be

used or occupied, and no change in ‘the existing occupancy classi- .

fication 6f a building or stmcture or portion thereof shall be made
until the building official has issued a certificatz cf occupancy
therefor as provxded herein.

EXCEPTION: Group R, Division 3 and Group U Occupancx-s

Issuance of a certificate of occupancy shall not b construed as
an approval of a violation of the pravisions of this ccde or of other
ordinances of the jurisdiction. Certificates | pr°sur:... to give au-
thority to violats or cancel the provisions of this cocz arother ordi-
nances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid.

109.2 Change in Use. Changes in the character or use of abuild-
ing shall not be made except as specified in Sec"‘\". 3405 of this
code. )

1093 Certificate Issued. After the building official inspects the
building or structure and finds no violations of tiz provisions of
this code or other laws that are enforced by the cods anforcement
agency, the building official shall issue a certificat2 of occupancy
that shall contain the following:

1. The building permit number.

2. The address of the building. - - = ==

3. The name and address of the owner.

4. A description of that portion of the building for which the

certificate is issued.

building has
=5 of this cade
2 ‘orwhich the

5. A statzment that the described portion of ¢
been inspectad for compliance with the raquirems
for the group and division of occupancy and the us
pr’*:}oS“d occupancy is classified.

6. The name of the building official.

109.4 Temporary Certificate. If the building ial finds that
no substantial hazard will result from occupancy o7 any building

cr portion thereof before the same is comol:::d 1 lzmperary cer-
tificate of occurancy may be issued for the use 07 a zanion or por-
tions cf a building or structure prior to the comp!
tuilding or structurs.

109.5 Posting. The certificats of cccupancy sh2
cnspicuous p'a:: on the premises and shall not

czot by the building official.

109.6 Revocation. The building official may, .vx.. ag, sus-
p*—'d or ravcke 1 certificata of occupancy issue
sions of this cocds whenever the certificate is isst \ :.‘or, aron
the basis of incorrect information sucp'1=d or whan it is deter-
mined that the building or structurz or po't'on thareafis in viola-
tion of any ordinance or regulation orany of the o7 sisions of this
coda.

1-6.3



Chula Vista Municipal Code

19.14.490

shall be filed with the city clerk in writing upon
forms provided by the director of planning and
building and be accompanied by the nonrefundable
required fee therefor. The appeal shall include a
statement of the reasons supporting the appeal, in-
cluding a demonstration that any issues being
raised were raised during the public hearing. If a
proper appeal is filed within the time limits speci-
fied, it automatically stays proceedings in the mat-
ter until a determination is made by the city council
on the appeal.

E. Upon the filing of the appeal, the city clerk
shall set the matter for public hearing, giving the
same notice as required in CVMC 19.12.070 and
19.12.080. The city clerk shall send the director of
planning and building a duplicate copy of the
appeal and shall transmit to the city council the
minutes of the hearing before the planning com-
mission and/or zoning administrator (if any), and
all other evidence, maps, papers and exhibits upon
which the planning commission made its decision.

F. After hearing the appeal, the city council
may, by resolution, affirm, reverse or modify, in
whole or in any part, any determination of the zon-
ing administrator or the planning commission. The
council resolution by which the appeal is decided
shall contain findings of facts showing wherein the
project meets or fails to meet the applicable site plan
and architectural principles in CVMC 19.14.470,
the provisions of the design manual, or any design
standards required for the project, or other noncon-
formity with the requirements of this chapter. A
copy of the decision resolution of the city council
shall be filed with the city clerk and mailed to the
applicant. (Ord. 2790, 1999, Ord. 2587 § 1, 1994,
Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.1313(A)(6)).

19.14.485 Landscape plan approval-Purpose
— Required when.

The purpose of landscape plan approval is to
determine compliance with this title and the provi-
sions of the landscape manual of the city. Land-
scape plan approval shall be required for the
following projects: multiple-family, commercial,
industrial, planned unit development, unclassified
uses, remodeling over $20,000 for the above uses,
developments with precise plans, parking lots with
five or more stalls and graded slopes. (Ord. 2616
§3,1994; Ord. 2011 § 2, 1982).

19.14.486 Landscape plan approval -
Application — Accompanying
documents — Fee.

A. Applications for landscape plan approval
shall be made to the zoning administrator, and shall
be accompanied by the drawings and information
prescribed by the landscape manual. Each applica-
tion shall also be accompanied by the required fil-
ing fee(s).

B. Appeal. The zoning administrator shall
approve, conditionally approve or deny landscape
plans. The applicant may appeal a denial or condi-
tions imposed upon approval by filing a written
appeal to the planning commission, in accordance
with CVMC 19.14.050, within 10 days of receipt
of notification of denial or conditional approval
from the zoning administrator. Such appeal shall
be in writing on the form promulgated by the
affected director, accompanied by the required fee,
and shall specify wherein the action of the zoning
administrator is inconsistent with the landscape
manual and/or other applicable ordinances, manu-
als or policies of the city. The planning commis-
sion may grant, conditionally grant, or deny the
appeal. The decision of the planning commission is
final, and shall be based upon the landscape man-
ual, and/or other applicable ordinances, manuals,
or policies of the city. (Ord. 2616 § 4, 1994; Ord.
2506 § 1, 1992; Ord. 2011 § 2, 1982).

19.14.490 Home occupations — Permit
required when — Restrictions and
requirements — Revocation when —
Appeals.

In any R zone, a customary home occupation
may be permitted subject to a home occupation
permit granted by the planning director which is
merely incidental and secondary to residence use.
Each such permit shall be accompanied by the
required filing fee(s). The following are typical
home occupations: fine arts, handicrafts, dress-
making, millinery, laundering, preserving, home
cooking, route salesman; or secondary office of a
doctor, dentist, lawyer, architect, engineer, teacher
or member of another recognized profession. The
home occupation shall not:

A. Involve the use of power equipment using
motors of more than a total of one horsepower
capacity or the equivalent thereof, unless a use per-
mit therefor shall have been issued by the planning
commission;

B. Generate vehicular traffic in excess of that
associated with a residential use;




19.14.500

C. Create a nuisance by reason of noise, dust,
odor, vibration, fumes, smoke, electrical interfer-
ence, or other causes,

D. Permitany external display of products, mer-
chandise, or any sign to identify the home occupa-
tion.

A home occupation permit shall be revoked by
the planning director upon violation of any require-
ment of this chapter, or of any conditions or limita-
tion of any permit issued, unless such violation is
corrected within 15 days of notice of such viola-
tion, and any such permit may be revoked for
repeated violation of the requirements of this sec-
tion or of the conditions of such permit.

" " In the event of denial of any permit, or the revo-
cation thereof, or of objection to the limitations
placed thereon, appeal may be made in writing to
the planning commission, whose decision shall be
final. (Ord. 2506 § 1, 1992; Ord. 2011 § 1, 1982;
Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.1314).

19.14.500 Zoning permit — Required when —
Exceptions.

The purpose of the zoning permit is to secure
compliance with the provisions of this title by
property owners requesting building permits. From
and after August 8, 1969, no owner shall establish
or permit the establishment of any new or changed
use of any land or building until a zoning permit
therefor has been issued by the building inspector;
provided, however, that no zoning permit shall be
required for the practice of horticulture or for graz-
ing of livestock. (Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code

$33.1315),

19.14.510 Zoning permit — Application.
Application shall be made by the property owner
or agent thereof on a form prescribed by the city,
and shall be accompanied by the required filing
fee(s). (Ord. 2506 § 1, 1992; Ord. 2011 § 1, 1982;
Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969: prior code § 33.1315(A)).

19.14.520 Zoning permit — Accompanying
documents required. _

The application shall be accompanied by draw-
ings required by the building code and, in addition,
by a plot plan showing the lot lines and dimensions
and locations of improvements with dimensions
and any other data necessary to show that yard
requirements and all other provisions of this title
are fulfilled. (Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code
§33.1313(B)).

19.14.530 Zoning permit — Issuance
prerequisites — Compliance
required.

It shall be the duty of the building inspector to is-
sue a zoning permit; provided, he is satisfied that
the structure, building, or premises, and the pro-
posed use thereof, conform with all requirements
within this title, and that all other reviews and ac-
tions, if any, called for in this title have been com-
plied with and all necessary approvals secured
therefor. (Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code §33.1315

(©))-

19.14.540 Zoning permit — Use limitations —
Display of permitrequired.

Land or buildings may be occupied and used
only for the use for which the zoning permit is
issued. Said zoning permit shall be displayed on the
site. (Ord. 1212 § 1, 1969; prior code § 33.1315

(D))-

19.14.550 Zoning permit — Grounds for
revocation — Notice required — Time
limit for use.

The zoning permit may be revoked in either of
the following situations:

A. Inany case where the conditions of such per-
mit have not been or are not complied with, the per-
mittee shall be given notice of intention to revoke
such permit at least 10 days prior to revocation.
After conclusion of said 10 days, the permit may be
revoked.

B. In any case where the zoning permit has not
been used within six months after the date of grant-
ing thereof, then, without further action, the permit
granted shall be null and void. (Ord. 1212 § 1,
1969; prior code § 33.1313(E)).

19.14.570 Precise plan approval.

Where use is made of the precise plan proce-
dure, as provided in this title, a zoning permit shall
not be issued for such development or part thereof
until the planning commission and city council
have approved a precise plan application for said
development as provided in CVMC 19.14.571
through 19.14.3580. (Ord. 1632 § 2, 1973).

19.14.571 Precise plan approval— Application
and fee.

Application shall be made on a form prescribed
for this purpose by the city and shall be accompa-
nied or preceded by a zone change application
establishing the P modifying district. The required
fee(s) shall accompany the precise plan applica-

19-52



